



1001 3RD Avenue West, Suite 670
 Bradenton, FL 34205
 941-708-4040
 Fax: 941-708-4024
 Federal Tax I.D. #65-0500793

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND
 C/O RONY JOEL
 50 BALD EAGLE DRIVE
 MARCO ISLAND, FLORIDA 34145

Invoice 73493 - 76612
 April 13, 2010

Re: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMIT

ID: 783-006 - KSH

CONFIDENTIAL- ATTORNEY CLIENT PRIVILEGED

For Services Rendered Through April 6, 2010

Current Fees	63,123.00
Current Disbursements	2,816.72
Total Current Charges	65,939.72
Total Current Due	65,939.72

Fee Recap

		Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
KEVIN S. HENNESSY	1 - EQUITY	65.40	250.00	16,350.00
STEPHEN A. WALKER	1 - EQUITY	1.00	250.00	250.00
JACK FIVEASH	3 - OF COUNSEL	0.50	50.00	25.00
LORI E. KILLINGER	4 - SENIOR ATTORNEY	0.90	220.00	198.00
R. DAVID JACKSON	5 - ASSOCIATE	231.50	200.00	46,300.00
Totals		299.30		63,123.00

Disbursements

Description	Amount
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL CHARGES	285.40
COST SURCHARGE	2,212.82
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES	100.00
MILEAGE CHARGES	218.50
Total Disbursements	2,816.72

Fees

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
09/01/09	RDJ	DRAFT, REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND	2.80	200.00	560.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 73493
 Page 2

		RECOVERY FACILITY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: SAME; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. JOEL.			
09/02/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL RE: VARIANCE; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE FROM D. JACKSON.	0.50	250.00	125.00
09/02/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FINAL ORDER GRANTING VARIANCE FROM STATE'S PRIMARY DRINKING WATER STANDARD; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS.	0.40	200.00	80.00
09/14/09	RDJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND CONSULTANT RE: UPCOMING MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; FOLLOW UP RE: SAME.	1.80	200.00	360.00
09/15/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS RE: SCHEDULING MEETING; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON.	0.30	250.00	75.00
09/16/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PERMITTING OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; REVIEW AND REVISE SUMMARY OF ISSUES TO PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT FIGURES FROM CONSULTANT RE: WATER QUALITY DATA AND FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: SAME.	2.20	200.00	440.00
09/16/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW REVISED QUESTIONS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS RE: MARCO LAKES FIGURES FROM J. MAHUT, L. HORVATH, D. JACKSON AND R. JOEL.	1.00	250.00	250.00
09/17/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; PREPARE AGENDA FOR MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	2.90	250.00	725.00
09/17/09	RDJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND CONSULTANTS RE: MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR INFORMATION; DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION FOR OPERATIONS PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN; REVIEW AND	5.50	200.00	1,100.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 73493
 Page 3

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: PERMITTING OF CITY'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.			
09/18/09	RDJ	DRAFT, REVISE RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY OPERATIONS PERMIT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN; REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED AGENDA FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.	5.80	200.00	1,160.00
09/18/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW AGENDA; REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME.	1.70	250.00	425.00
09/21/09	RDJ	REVISE LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN RESPONSE TO SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RE: PERMIT FOR OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS AND CONSULTANTS RE: UPCOMING MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.70	200.00	340.00
09/21/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL RE: AGENDA AND TO D. RHODES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM D. RHODES; PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL.	1.20	250.00	300.00
09/22/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. PEARCE (ENTRIX) RE: DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION AND FOLLOW UP; REVISE RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RE: OPERATIONS PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; FOLLOW UP CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	2.20	200.00	440.00
09/22/09	KSH	REVIEW AND REVISE REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RESPONSE; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME; EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON; REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBITS.	2.90	250.00	725.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 4

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
09/23/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE POTENTIAL EXHIBITS FOR USE DURING UPCOMING MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PREPARE FOR MEETING; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND CONSULTANTS TO DISCUSS RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION FOR PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND STRATEGY FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION AND FOLLOW UP RE: SAME.	4.50	200.00	900.00
09/23/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE ON PREPARATIONS FOR MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; FINALIZE RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBITS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM L. HORVATH.	3.50	250.00	875.00
09/24/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE EXHIBITS FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CONSULTANTS RE: REVISIONS TO SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. HORVATH; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT DATA SUMMARY AND REVISE SAME; ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.50	200.00	300.00
09/24/09	KSH	FINALIZE EXHIBITS FOR MEETING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. HORVATH RE: MEETING; EMAIL TEAM RE: MEETING; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.80	250.00	450.00
09/25/09	KSH	TRAVEL TO FORT MYERS FOR MEETING WITH CLIENT AND FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RETURN TRAVEL TO BRADENTON.	7.00	250.00	1,750.00
09/28/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RESPOND TO SAME; PREPARE MINUTES OF MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION	1.00	250.00	250.00
10/01/09	RDJ	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS. □	0.30	200.00	60.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 5

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
10/02/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS AND CONSULTANTS RE: FOLLOW UP TO MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION. □ □	0.50	200.00	100.00
10/05/09	KSH	ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS; PREPARE MINUTES FROM MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.00	250.00	250.00
10/05/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: ACTION ITEMS FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEETING; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEETING MINUTES AND CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME; PREPARE SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH PARTIES RE: CONFERENCE CALL WITH COLLIER COUNTY STAFF.	2.70	200.00	540.00
10/06/09	KSH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN; RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT; PREPARE CHANGES TO EMAIL; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH COUNTY; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	3.50	250.00	875.00
10/06/09	RDJ	SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS; REVISE MINUTES FROM MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; DRAFT SUPPLEMENT TO RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, CONSULTANTS, AND COLLIER COUNTY REPRESENTATIVES RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS AND RELATED ISSUES; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS AND CONFER WITH S. WALKER, K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.	3.30	200.00	660.00
10/06/09	SAW	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES.	0.50	250.00	125.00
10/07/09	KSH	FINALIZE MINUTES FROM MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: CONCERN OVER ORDINANCE; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	0.00	250.00	
10/07/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; REVISE, FINALIZE MINUTES TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEETING AND	2.20	200.00	440.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 73493
 Page 6

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		TRANSMIT SAME TO D. RHODES (DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION); RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS TO PROTECT AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.			
10/07/09	SAW	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY RE: ISSUES.	0.50	250.00	125.00
10/08/09	KSH	REVIEW AND REVISE REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RESPONSE; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	0.50	250.00	125.00
10/08/09	RDJ	DRAFT, REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: SAME; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS TO PROTECT AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	3.50	200.00	700.00
10/09/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS AND CONSULTANTS RE: MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND RESPONSES TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION WITH REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION #3; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL AND L. HORVATH.	1.90	250.00	475.00
10/09/09	RDJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, CONSULTANTS RE: SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS TO PROTECT SAME.	1.50	200.00	300.00
10/12/09	RDJ	REVISE SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RE: OPERATION PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: SAME.	1.90	200.00	380.00
10/13/09	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: WATER RIGHTS; RESEARCH CONCERNING INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS RELATED TO WELLFIELD AND WELLHEAD PROTECTION AND	2.50	200.00	500.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 7

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		COLLIER COUNTY LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RE: GROUNDWATER PROTECTION; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.			
10/14/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: MINUTES FROM SEPTEMBER 25 MEETING; RESEARCH CONCERNING LOCAL GOVERNMENT ORDINANCES TO PROTECT GROUNDWATER SOURCES AND WELLFIELDS.	1.30	200.00	260.00
10/14/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. HABERFELD; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON.	0.30	250.00	75.00
10/15/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. HABERFIELD; RESPOND TO SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH; RESPOND TO SAME; SCHEDULE CALL WITH MARCO ISLAND.	1.00	250.00	250.00
10/15/09	RDJ	SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CONSULTANTS RE: STATUS OF INFORMATION TO BE PREPARED FOR SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN AND J. MAYHUT (ENTRIX) RE: APPROVALS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND REVIEW, ORGANIZE SAME; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS LOCAL GOVERNMENT ORDINANCES AND LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RELATED TO PROTECTION OF WATER RESOURCES AND WATER RIGHTS; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RELATED TO PROTECTION OF MARCO LAKES AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.	2.90	200.00	580.00
10/16/09	RDJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND CONSULTANTS RE: RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION AND RELATED ISSUES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT ANNUAL REPORT FOR MARCO LAKES AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY (CYCLE 8E) AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT, CONSULTANT RE: PROPOSED REVISIONS TO SAME; DRAFT, REVISE RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S THIRD REQUEST	3.10	200.00	620.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 8

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		FOR INFORMATION AND TRANSMIT SAME TO CLIENT, CONSULTANTS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY, WATER RIGHTS, AND PROTECTION OF WATER RESOURCES.			
10/16/09	KSH	ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH TEAM; REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR INFORMATION #3; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS BETWEEN TEAM; DRAFT REQUEST FOR INFORMATION #3; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL.	2.20	250.00	550.00
10/16/09	JF	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: ASR SYSTEM WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT OVERSIGHT.	0.50	50.00	25.00
10/19/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CONSULTANT RE: ANNUAL REPORT; RESEARCH CONCERNING ORDINANCES AND LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RE: WELLFIELD AND WELLHEAD PROTECTION; RESEARCH CONCERNING SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RULES RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND WELLFIELD PROTECTION; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY. □	2.70	200.00	540.00
10/20/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW MARCO ISLAND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RESPONSES #3; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH.	0.30	250.00	75.00
10/20/09	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION AND RESEARCH CONCERNING INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS UTILIZED BY LOCAL GOVERNMENTS TO PROTECT AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND WELLFIELDS; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: STATUS OF RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION.	1.50	200.00	300.00
10/21/09	RDJ	PREPARE LANGUAGE FOR POSSIBLE ORDINANCE FOR COLLIER COUNTY TO PROTECT CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; RESEARCH CONCERNING INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS USED BY OTHER LOCAL GOVERNMENTS TO PROTECT WATER RESOURCES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RULES RE: SAME.	2.50	200.00	500.00
10/22/09	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO GOVERNMENT RESTRICTIONS ON PUBLIC'S WATER USE AND VARIOUS INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS USED	1.60	200.00	320.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 9

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		BY LOCAL GOVERNMENTS TO PROTECT WATER RESOURCES.			
10/23/09	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO LOCAL GOVERNMENTS' PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS AND OTHER WATER RESOURCES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RULES RE: PROTECTION OF WATER RESOURCES; PREPARE LANGUAGE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	2.30	200.00	460.00
10/26/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. HORVATH (ENTRIX) RE: SUBMITTAL TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RESEARCH CONCERNING INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS, PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS AND WELLHEADS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RULES RE: PROTECTION OF WATER RESOURCES; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE/AMENDMENT TO LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY. □	2.90	200.00	580.00
10/26/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. GENZLER, ATTORNEY FOR QUALITY ENTERPRISES, RE: STATUS OF RESPONSE TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY'S REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION. □	0.20	200.00	40.00
10/27/09	RDJ	DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR POTENTIAL COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE/AMENDMENT TO LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS AND GOVERNMENT PROTECTION OF WATER RESOURCES.	2.10	200.00	420.00
10/28/09	RDJ	PREPARE LANGUAGE FOR POSSIBLE ORDINANCE/AMENDMENT TO LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RULES RE: PROTECTION OF WATER RESOURCES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW SUBMITTAL MADE TO DEPARTMENT OF	2.10	200.00	420.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010

Invoice 73493

Page 10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN RESPONSE TO THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RE: OPERATING PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.			
10/29/09	RDJ	DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR POSSIBLE ORDINANCE/AMENDMENT TO LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE FOR COLLIER COUNTY FOR PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR RESTRICTING WATER USE AND PROTECTING WATER RESOURCES.	2.60	200.00	520.00
10/30/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RULES RE: PROTECTION OF WATER RESOURCES; RESEARCH CONCERNING INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS USED FOR PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS, AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND OTHER WATER RESOURCES; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR ORDINANCE OR AMENDMENT TO LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	2.80	200.00	560.00
11/02/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY SYSTEMS AND DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: SAME.	3.30	200.00	660.00
11/03/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ISSUES RELATED TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT RULES, LOCAL GOVERNMENT ORDINANCES, AND INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: SAME.	2.50	200.00	500.00
11/04/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY DATA AND FOLLOW UP; DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS AND AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SAME.	2.00	200.00	400.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010

Invoice 73493

Page 11

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
11/04/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW INFORMATION ON LEGISLATIVE WATER COMMITTEE; FORWARD TO R. JOEL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE.	1.40	250.00	350.00
11/05/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: SUPPORT FOR INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	2.40	200.00	480.00
11/05/09	KSH	EMAIL R. JOEL DETAILS RE: LEGISLATIVE COMMITTEE; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE.	1.00	250.00	250.00
11/06/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS BY COLLIER COUNTY FOR PROTECTION OF MARCO LAKES AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; DRAFT MEMORANDUM LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SAME.	3.00	200.00	600.00
11/09/09	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS AND AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.	1.20	200.00	240.00
11/11/09	RDJ	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS WITH COLLIER COUNTY; RESEARCH CONCERNING ORDINANCES RE: PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS AND AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND DRAFT LANGUAGE RE: SAME.	1.90	200.00	380.00
11/13/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN CLIENT AND SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT STAFF RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND FOLLOW UP. □	0.60	200.00	120.00
11/16/09	LEK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. HENNESSY RE: ASR ISSUE.	0.40	220.00	88.00
11/17/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: STATUS OF VARIOUS ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: SAME.	0.40	200.00	80.00
11/18/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS.	0.30	200.00	60.00
11/23/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE ORDINANCES AND VARIOUS	0.80	200.00	160.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 12

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION.			
11/24/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. JOEL, B. WEINSTEIN, D. JACKSON, AND ENTRIX.	1.50	250.00	375.00
11/24/09	LEK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON AND K. HENNESSY RE: POTENTIAL LEGAL STRATEGIES.	0.50	220.00	110.00
11/24/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE ORDINANCES AND VARIOUS LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE. □	2.50	200.00	500.00
11/30/09	RDJ	DRAFT PROPOSED LANGUAGE FOR COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE TO PROVIDE PROTECTION FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SAME.	1.60	200.00	320.00
12/01/09	RDJ	DRAFT PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS.	1.80	200.00	360.00
12/02/09	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS; DRAFT PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY. □	1.50	200.00	300.00
12/03/09	RDJ	DRAFT PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	2.20	200.00	440.00
12/04/09	RDJ	DRAFT, REVISE PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	2.70	200.00	540.00
12/04/09	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE; RECEIVE AND REVIEW INITIAL DRAFT OF ORDINANCE.	5.00	250.00	1,250.00
12/08/09	RDJ	REVISE PROPOSED ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF ASR FACILITIES AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SAME.	1.60	200.00	320.00
12/10/09	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING RESTRICTIONS ON WELLS AND RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROTECTION OF ASR FACILITIES.	1.20	200.00	240.00
12/11/09	RDJ	REVISE PROPOSED ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF ASR FACILITIES IN COLLIER COUNTY AND RESEARCH	1.70	200.00	340.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 13

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		CONCERNING SAME.			
12/14/09	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING RESTRICTIONS ON LAND USE IN PROXIMITY TO WELLFIELDS; DRAFT AND REVISE PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF ASR FACILITIES IN COLLIER COUNTY.	2.20	200.00	440.00
12/15/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF ASR FACILITIES; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CONSULTANTS.	2.50	200.00	500.00
12/22/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE; RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO WELLFIELD PROTECTION.	1.30	200.00	260.00
12/29/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH R. JOEL RE: MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY; PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING RELATED ISSUES.	1.60	200.00	320.00
12/30/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. JACKSON AND R. JOEL; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.10	250.00	275.00
12/30/09	RDJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, CONSULTANTS RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND UPCOMING MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY RE: SAME; RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF EXISTING AND FUTURE WELLFIELDS AND DRAFT PROPOSED AMENDMENT TO SAME; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. HORVATH RE: REVISIONS TO PROPOSED ORDINANCE.	3.80	200.00	760.00
12/31/09	RDJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, CONSULTANTS RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND UPCOMING MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY RE: SAME; RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF EXISTING AND FUTURE WELLFIELDS AND DRAFT PROPOSED AMENDMENT TO SAME; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE	2.60	200.00	520.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010

Invoice 73493

Page 14

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		WITH L. HORVATH RE: REVISIONS TO PROPOSED ORDINANCE.			
01/04/10	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCES RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY TO DISCUSS PROPOSED ORDINANCE.	2.80	200.00	560.00
01/05/10	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO ORDINANCES PROTECTING WATER RESOURCES; PREPARE SUMMARY OF CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN CLIENT AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS; REVISE, FINALIZE DRAFT OF PROPOSED ORDINANCE TO PRESENT AT MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY STAFF.	3.50	200.00	700.00
01/06/10	RDJ	TRAVEL TO, TRAVEL FROM, PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH CLIENT, CONSULTANT, AND COLLIER COUNTY STAFF TO DISCUSS PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND FOLLOW UP.	6.80	200.00	1,360.00
01/07/10	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS WITH COLLIER COUNTY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE COLLIER COUNTY'S WELLFIELD PROTECTION ORDINANCE.	1.50	200.00	300.00
01/08/10	RDJ	DRAFT LETTER TO D. RHODES (DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION) RE: MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY AND FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. JOEL; RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND REVIEW AND REVISE EXISTING COLLIER COUNTY WELLFIELD PROTECTION ORDINANCE.	2.60	200.00	520.00
01/08/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW LETTER TO D. RHODES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL TO R. JOEL.	0.30	250.00	75.00
01/11/10	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMIT FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; REVIEW AND REVISE COLLIER COUNTY'S EXISTING ORDINANCE RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH K. HENNESSY RE: STATUS.	1.90	200.00	380.00
01/11/10	KSH	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: STATUS OF COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE.	0.30	250.00	75.00
01/13/10	RDJ	REVISE EXISTING COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE AND LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RE: PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS AND RESEARCH	1.60	200.00	320.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 15

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		CONCERNING SAME; LEFT VOICE MAIL FOR J. WHITE, COLLIER COUNTY ATTORNEY.			
01/15/10	RDJ	DRAFT, REVISE COLLIER COUNTY'S EXISTING ORDINANCE AND LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMIT FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	2.30	200.00	460.00
01/21/10	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS; REVIEW AND REVISE EXISTING COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION.	1.40	200.00	280.00
01/25/10	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S INTENT TO GRANT A WATER QUALITY CRITERIA EXEMPTION FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.	0.40	200.00	80.00
01/25/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION INTENT TO GRANT WATER QUALITY EXEMPTION; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME.	0.40	250.00	100.00
01/26/10	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. WHITE, ATTORNEY FOR COLLIER COUNTY, RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL.	0.40	200.00	80.00
02/09/10	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: STATUS OF ORDINANCE WITH COLLIER COUNTY AND FOLLOW UP.	0.30	200.00	60.00
02/10/10	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: DRAFTS OF DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER RELATED TO CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE SAME.	1.10	200.00	220.00
02/11/10	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFTS OF DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; PREPARE REVISIONS TO SAME; DRAFT PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS RELATED TO PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES IN COLLIER COUNTY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SAME.	2.30	200.00	460.00
02/12/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT PERMIT AND	2.30	250.00	575.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 16

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
02/12/10	RDJ	ASR OPERATION; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON. TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. WHITE, COLLIER COUNTY ATTORNEY, RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND FOLLOW UP RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFTS OF PROPOSED DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND REVISE SAME; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; CONFER WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: DISCUSSION OF DRAFT PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER.	2.90	200.00	580.00
02/16/10	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED EDITS TO DRAFT PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER FROM CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COLLIER COUNTY ATTORNEY RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE; DRAFT PROPOSED ORDINANCE RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	2.20	200.00	440.00
02/17/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW GENERAL CONSENT ORDER; GENERIC ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDERS ISSUED TO TAMPA AND PEACE RIVER; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME.	1.90	250.00	475.00
02/17/10	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY OPERATION; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS; RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND DRAFT, REVISE LANGUAGE RE: SAME.	2.70	200.00	540.00
02/18/10	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. WHITE, COLLIER COUNTY ATTORNEY, RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; DRAFT PERMITS FOR OPERATION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENTS, AND CONSULTANTS RE: ISSUES REGARDING	3.90	200.00	780.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 73493
 Page 17

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND FOLLOW UP RE: SAME.			
02/22/10	RDJ	REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS RECEIVED FROM CLIENTS AND CONSULTANTS; PREPARE REVISED DOCUMENTS AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	1.90	200.00	380.00
02/23/10	RDJ	DRAFT, REVISE LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S DRAFTS OF PROPOSED PERMITS FOR OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER PERTAINING TO SAME.	2.40	200.00	480.00
02/24/10	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND FOLLOW UP WITH CONSULTANT; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER.	1.20	200.00	240.00
02/25/10	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: SCHEDULING OF MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION TO DISCUSS PROPOSED PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER.	1.50	200.00	300.00
02/26/10	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: SCHEDULING MEETINGS WITH MARCO ISLAND.	0.30	250.00	75.00
02/26/10	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT, CONSULTANT RE: FOLLOW UP MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFTS OF PROPOSED DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER FOR OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; RESEARCH CONCERNING INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND DRAFT, REVISE PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: SAME; CONFER WITH J. WHITE, COLLIER COUNTY ATTORNEY, RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE.	2.60	200.00	520.00
03/01/10	KSH	SCHEDULE MEETING; OFFICE CONFERENCE RE: MEETING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER.	0.70	250.00	175.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 18

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
03/01/10	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS RE: OPERATION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; DRAFT, REVISE PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	3.20	200.00	640.00
03/02/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER REVISIONS; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.00	250.00	250.00
03/02/10	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S DRAFT PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	2.40	200.00	480.00
03/03/10	RDJ	DRAFT, REVISE LANGUAGE FOR COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; LEFT VOICEMAIL FOR J. WHITE, COLLIER COUNTY ATTORNEY, RE: SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S DRAFTS OF PERMITS FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	3.10	200.00	620.00
03/04/10	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS IN WELLFIELDS; DRAFT, REVISE LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE; REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS FOR MARCO LAKES AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT RE: REVISED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER.	2.60	200.00	520.00
03/05/10	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE	1.80	200.00	360.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 19

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		ORDER AND PERMITS.			
03/08/10	KSH	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: STATUS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW LATEST REVISIONS; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. JOEL AND CONSULTANTS; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	2.50	250.00	625.00
03/08/10	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT RE: REVISIONS TO DRAFT PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND CONSULTANTS; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION POLICIES AND PRIOR ADMINISTRATIVE ORDERS INVOLVING OTHER AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND PREPARE, ORGANIZE COPIES OF SAME FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PREPARE AGENDA FOR MEETING; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY.	4.20	200.00	840.00
03/09/10	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN FORT MYERS; RETURN TO BRADENTON.	6.00	250.00	1,500.00
03/09/10	RDJ	TRAVEL TO, TRAVEL FROM, PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, CONSULTANTS, AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: PROPOSED PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; FOLLOW UP RE: ISSUES RAISED DURING MEETING.	6.00	200.00	1,200.00
03/10/10	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT PERMITS FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMIT CONDITIONS AND PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE.	2.30	200.00	460.00
03/11/10	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: GENERAL PERMIT CONDITIONS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY PERMITS AND PROPOSED INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS; DRAFT, REVISE LANGUAGE	2.50	200.00	500.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		FOR COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE RE: PROTECTION OF WELLFIELDS.			
03/15/10	RDJ	CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; RESEARCH CONCERNING GENERAL PERMIT CONDITIONS; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENTS RE: SAME. □ □	1.50	200.00	300.00
03/15/10	KSH	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM CONSULTANTS AND CLIENTS; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.10	250.00	275.00
03/16/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON TO D. RHODES WITH DRAFT PERMITS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE FROM D. RHODES.	0.30	250.00	75.00
03/16/10	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: REVISIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RELATED ISSUES; REVISE, FINALIZE PERMITS AND TRANSMIT SAME TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLFIELDS AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	2.20	200.00	440.00
03/17/10	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. RHODES (DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION) AND DRAFT ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER.	0.50	200.00	100.00
03/18/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. RHODES WITH REVISED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM C. CHRISTEN.	1.00	250.00	250.00
03/18/10	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND OTHER ADMINISTRATIVE ORDERS ISSUED BY DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.	1.70	200.00	340.00
03/19/10	RDJ	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY RE: PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY OPERATIONS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS PREPARED BY DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; RESEARCH CONCERNING INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS AND DRAFT, REVISE LANGUAGE RE: PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE.	1.90	200.00	380.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 21

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
03/22/10	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING COLLIER COUNTY LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE PROVISIONS RE: WELLFIELD PROTECTION; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER TO BE ISSUED WITH PERMITS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY OPERATIONS.	2.60	200.00	520.00
03/23/10	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PREPARE NOTES RE: SAME; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: PROPOSED DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS; RESEARCH CONCERNING WELLFIELD RESTRICTION AND REVIEW AND REVISE LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE.	2.80	200.00	560.00
03/24/10	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DIVISION OF WASTE MANAGEMENT'S INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS PROCEDURES GUIDANCE AND FOLLOW UP RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; DRAFT, REVISE LANGUAGE FOR PROPOSED COLLIER COUNTY ORDINANCE TO PROTECT AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: VARIOUS ISSUES.	3.30	200.00	660.00
03/25/10	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS.	1.50	250.00	375.00
03/25/10	RDJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND CONSULTANT RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND PERMITS FOR MARCO LAKES AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; REVIEW AND REVISE ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT, CONSULTANTS RE: SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS PROCEDURES GUIDANCE.	2.80	200.00	560.00
03/26/10	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S INSTITUTIONAL	1.50	200.00	300.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 22

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		CONTROLS PROCEDURES GUIDANCE AND RELATED RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.			
		+			
03/29/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW REVISIONS TO ADMINISTRATIVE ORDERS.	0.30	250.00	75.00
03/29/10	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: REVISED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; REVIEW AND REVISE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES IN COLLIER COUNTY.	1.40	200.00	280.00
03/30/10	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT RE: REVISED ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND RELATED ISSUES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S GUIDANCE DOCUMENT ON INSTITUTIONAL CONTROLS PROCEDURES.	1.30	200.00	260.00
03/31/10	RDJ	STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY RE: ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. WEINSTEIN AND J. MAYHUT (ENTRIX) RE: DATA; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT PERMITS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND TRANSMIT SAME TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: PROPOSED ORDINANCE FOR PROTECTION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES IN COLLIER COUNTY; DRAFT, REVISE PROPOSED ORDINANCE LANGUAGE AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	3.10	200.00	620.00
03/31/10	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME.	1.00	250.00	250.00

Total Fees	299.30	63,123.00
-------------------	---------------	------------------

Disbursements

Date	Description	Amount
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL CHARGES	285.40
	COST SURCHARGE	2,212.82
01/15/10	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES; PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED NOVEMBER 2009; JOHN LEWIS FIVEASH, JR., PA	100.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 73493
Page 23

Date	Description	Amount
01/13/10	MILEAGE CHARGES; ATTEND MEETING WITH COLLIER COUNTY RE: CITY OF MARCO ISLAND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMIT MATTER ON 1/6/10; R. DAVID JACKSON	122.50
03/29/10	MILEAGE CHARGES; MEETING WITH DEP (FORT MYERS) ON 3/9/10; KEVIN HENNESSY	96.00
Total Disbursements		2,816.72
