



1001 3RD Avenue West, Suite 670
 Bradenton, FL 34205
 941-708-4040
 Fax: 941-708-4024
 Federal Tax I.D. #65-0500793

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND
 C/O RONY JOEL
 50 BALD EAGLE DRIVE
 MARCO ISLAND, FLORIDA 34145

Invoice 59657 - 73533
 April 13, 2010

Re: DEWATERING SITE NOTICE OF VIOLATION

ID: 783-004 - KSH

CONFIDENTIAL- ATTORNEY CLIENT PRIVILEGED

For Services Rendered Through November 4, 2009

Current Fees	101,289.00	
Current Disbursements	102,133.66	
Total Current Charges	203,422.66	
Total Current Due		203,422.66

Fee Recap

		Hours	Rate/Hour	Amount
KEVIN S. HENNESSY	1 - EQUITY	67.40	250.00	16,850.00
KEVIN S. HENNESSY	1 - EQUITY	72.60	245.00	17,787.00
JULIA L. JENNISON	5 - ASSOCIATE	0.50	160.00	80.00
R. DAVID JACKSON	5 - ASSOCIATE	155.80	200.00	31,160.00
R. DAVID JACKSON	5 - ASSOCIATE	179.80	195.00	35,061.00
MELANIE MARKEN	8 - PARALEGAL	0.20	105.00	21.00
MELANIE MARKEN	8 - PARALEGAL	3.30	100.00	330.00
Totals		479.60		101,289.00

Disbursements

Description	Amount
COST SURCHARGE	3,545.17
	76.75
COMPUTER RESEARCH	27.84
TELEPHONE CHARGES	12.38
POSTAGE CHARGES	5.02
	34,607.77
	27,539.51
	21,363.49

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 2

Description	Amount
BUSINESS MEETING	8,342.05
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL CHARGES	560.59
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES	166.26
Total Disbursements	102,133.66

Fees

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
11/09/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS RE: FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION WARNING LETTER; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: RESPONSE; PREPARE EMAIL RESPONSE TO R. JOEL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL TO FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION FROM D. JACKSON.	1.00	245.00	245.00
11/09/07	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW WARNING LETTER TO CLIENT FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND RESPONSE; CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS TO DISCUSS MATTER; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS FROM CLIENT; DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.	2.80	195.00	546.00
11/12/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. REED; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. GABRIAL; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. GABRIAL; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH CITY OF MARCO.	1.00	245.00	245.00
11/12/07	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RE: ALLEGED DEWATERING VIOLATION AND FOLLOW UP RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; VARIOUS PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CITY STAFF.	2.40	195.00	468.00
11/13/07	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS NATIONAL POLLUTANT DISCHARGE ELIMINATION SYSTEM PERMITS; PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CITY STAFF RE: PENDING ENFORCEMENT MATTER WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.60	195.00	312.00
11/14/07	RDJ	SEVERAL PHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DEWATERING ISSUE; RESEARCH CONCERNING WASTEWATER PERMITTING AND NPDES PERMITS; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH REPORTER RE: DEWATERING ISSUE.	4.40	195.00	858.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010

Invoice 59657

Page 3

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
11/14/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. MOSS.	0.30	245.00	73.50
11/15/07	KSH	ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. DOUGLASS, R. JOEL, B. MOSS AND D. JACKSON RE: PERMIT ISSUES AND CONTACT WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. LEWIS RE: M. DREW; RECEIVE AND REVIEW WATER USE PERMIT; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. IGLEHART; RECEIVE AND REVIEW POTENTIAL PERMITS.	3.80	245.00	931.00
11/15/07	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW SOUTHWEST FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT PERMIT FOR DEWATERING ASSOCIATED WITH SEPTIC TANK REPLACEMENT PROGRAM; RESEARCH CONCERNING DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RULES RE: NPDES AND WASTEWATER PERMITTING; SEVERAL PHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DEWATERING ISSUE.	5.00	195.00	975.00
11/16/07	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM L. DOUGLASS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW PHOTOS; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: REMAINDER OF CALL; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: PUBLIC RECORDS AND MEETING; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH CITY RE: OPTIONS; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. IGLEHART RE: STATUS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION FOR RECORDS.	3.90	245.00	955.50
11/16/07	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMIT FOR WEST WINTERBERRY SEWER EXPANSION; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF; RECEIVE AND REVIEW PHOTOS OF CURRENT CONSTRUCTION ACTIVITIES; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: DEWATERING ISSUE AND FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY STAFF; FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND J. IGLEHART (DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION); PHONE CONFERENCE AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. AHMADI (DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL	6.20	195.00	1,209.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 4

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		PROTECTION) RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION INVESTIGATION AND SCHEDULING OF MEETING; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RE: DEWATERING MATTER; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH REPORTER RE: DEWATERING ISSUE.			
11/19/07	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH MARCO ISLAND; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS BETWEEN D. JACKSON AND FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: DOCUMENTS AND MEETING.	2.00	245.00	490.00
11/19/07	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RE: DEWATERING MATTER; SEVERAL PHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF RE: DEWATERING MATTER; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: DEWATERING MATTER; RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND OTHER INFORMATION FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: INVESTIGATION OF DEWATERING MATTER; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF RE: VARIOUS ISSUES.	4.80	195.00	936.00
11/20/07	RDJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF RE: STATUS OF DEWATERING ISSUE; SEVERAL FOLLOW UP PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CITY STAFF; SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF; RESEARCH CONCERNING DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND SOUTHWEST FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT PERMITTING AND RULES RE: DEWATERING AND VARIOUS OTHER ISSUES.	4.10	195.00	799.50
11/20/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW VOICE MAIL FROM L. DOUGLASS; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL WITH INVOICE; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY OF MARCO ISLAND; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.90	245.00	465.50
11/21/07	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH REPORTER RE: STATUS OF MATTER; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL AND B. MOSS RE: STATUS; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.00	245.00	245.00
11/21/07	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RE: DEWATERING MATTER AND PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL	2.60	195.00	507.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 5

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		PROTECTION.			
11/26/07	RDJ	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: DEWATERING ISSUE; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES.	2.50	195.00	487.50
11/26/07	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: TESTING AND PREPARATIONS FOR MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW IMPLEMENTATION AGREEMENT.	1.50	245.00	367.50
11/27/07	KSH	TRAVEL TO FT. MYERS; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH R. JOEL; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; WORK SESSION WITH CITY; RETURN TO BRADENTON.	6.00	245.00	1,470.00
11/27/07	RDJ	TRAVEL TO FT. MYERS; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY AND R. JOEL; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: DEWATERING ISSUE; FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT; FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: WATER SAMPLING; TRAVEL FROM FT. MYERS.	6.00	195.00	1,170.00
11/28/07	KSH	LEAVE VOICE MAIL WITH ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARCO ISLAND TIMES; LEAVE VOICE MAIL WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. DEVAULT; LEAVE VOICE MAIL WITH SOUTHWEST FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. MOSS; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY OF MARCO ISLAND.	2.30	245.00	563.50
11/28/07	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. DEVAULT (DEP) RE: PARAMETERS FOR GENERIC PERMIT FOR DISCHARGE OF GROUNDWATER AND FOLLOW UP PHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. BEESON (CDM) AND CITY STAFF RE: SAME; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RE: DEWATERING MATTER; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DEWATERING MATTER AND FOLLOW UP.	3.30	195.00	643.50
11/29/07	RDJ	DRAFT LETTER TO T. BENSON (CDM) RE: SCOPE OF WORK; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PROCEDURES AND PERMITTING; EMAIL	4.20	195.00	819.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 6

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: INFORMATION REQUESTED FOR ACTIVE GENERIC PERMITS FOR GROUNDWATER DISCHARGE AND LETTERS TO MUNICIPALITIES RE: DEWATERING ACTIVITIES; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BENSON (CDM) RE: STATUS OF SITE WORK; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF RE: DEWATERING ISSUE; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY RE: RESPONSE TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY ATTORNEY; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF RE: DEWATERING ACTIVITIES.			
11/29/07	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH MARCO ISLAND; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BUSH OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. POTTS OF DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH MARCO ISLAND; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; PREPARE EMAIL TO B. BUSH; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. DOUGLASS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL.	4.40	245.00	1,078.00
11/30/07	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: STATUS OF SAMPLING; REVIEW CONTRACT FROM CDM.	1.00	245.00	245.00
11/30/07	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF RE: DEWATERING ISSUE; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: STATUS OF SITE WORK; ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS AND RESEARCH RE: GROUNDWATER DISCHARGE PERMITTING, DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT PROGRAMS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW SCOPE OF WORK AND COST PROPOSAL FROM CDM FOR SITE WORK.	2.40	195.00	468.00
12/03/07	KSH	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: PHONE CALL FROM R. JOEL; PREPARE EMAIL TO B. BUSH RE: STATUS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL.	0.50	245.00	122.50
12/03/07	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: STATUS OF DEWATERING ACTIVITIES AND FOLLOW UP; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RE: CONSTRUCTION DEWATERING AND PERMITTING; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY.	2.40	195.00	468.00
12/04/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. BUSH; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON RE: SAMPLE RESULTS; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T.	1.50	245.00	367.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 7

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		BEESON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM T. BEESON; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT.			
12/04/07	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT ISSUES; PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CITY STAFF AND T. BEESON (CDM) RE: WATER QUALITY SAMPLING AND VARIOUS OTHER ISSUES; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY ATTORNEY.	3.00	195.00	585.00
12/05/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW SAMPLE RESULTS FROM CDM; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. MERRIAM; ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY OF MARCO ISLAND; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER TO A. AHMADI.	2.00	245.00	490.00
12/05/07	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE WATER SAMPLING RESULTS; RESEARCH CONCERNING PERMITTING AND DEWATERING ISSUES; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY STAFF, CONSULTANTS AND K. HENNESSY RE: WATER SAMPLING RESULTS AND WATER ISSUES; DRAFT LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: WATER SAMPLING RESULTS AND PROCEEDING WITH PROJECT.	5.20	195.00	1,014.00
12/06/07	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. JACKSON; REVIEW AND REVISE EMAIL; RESPOND TO SAME.	0.50	245.00	122.50
12/06/07	RDJ	SEVERAL PHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY OF MARCO ISLAND STAFF AND T. BEESON (CDM) RE: LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND RELATED ISSUES; REVISE AND FINALIZE LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: WATER SAMPLING, PERMITTING AND CONSTRUCTION ISSUES; DRAFT, EDIT AND FINALIZE FOLLOW UP LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	3.00	195.00	585.00
12/07/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS RE: SAMPLING; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH NEWS REPORTER; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. MERRIAM.	1.00	245.00	245.00
12/07/07	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. AHMADI (DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION) RE: GROUNDWATER SAMPLING AND FOLLOW UP PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CITY STAFF AND T. BEESON (CDM) RE: SAME; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY RE: DEWATERING ISSUES; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND REPORTER FROM	4.60	195.00	897.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 8

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		MARCO ISLAND NEWS; RESEARCH CONCERNING DEWATERING AND PERMITTING ISSUES AND CLEAN WATER ACT; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: CURRENTLY ACTIVE GENERIC PERMITS AND LETTERS SENT TO MUNICIPALITIES RE: DEWATERING ACTIVITIES.			
12/10/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON WITH NEWS ARTICLE; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BUSH RE: STATUS AND INQUIRY; SEND OUT CLEAN WATER ACT INQUIRY; RECEIVE AND REVIEW SAMPLING DATA; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: CALL FROM R. JOEL.	2.80	245.00	686.00
12/10/07	JLJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO K. HENNESSY EMAIL RE: NPDES PERMITS FOR DEWATERING REQUIRED TO CONSTRUCT SEWER LINES.	0.50	160.00	80.00
12/10/07	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLEAN WATER ACT DISCHARGE PERMITTING ISSUES; PHONE CONFERENCE AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO DEWATERING MATTER.	5.80	195.00	1,131.00
12/11/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL RE: EPA; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. AHMADI RE: EPA QUESTIONS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EPA EMAIL WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. AHMADI; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON.	1.20	245.00	294.00
12/11/07	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLEAN WATER ACT PERMITTING AND VARIOUS ISSUES RE: CONSTRUCTION DEWATERING AND GROUNDWATER DISCHARGE; PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CITY STAFF RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO DEWATERING MATTER.	5.00	195.00	975.00
12/12/07	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAMPLING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. DOUGLASS; RESPOND TO SAME; VOICE MAIL FOR J. WOLFE; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM T. BEESON RE: TOC SAMPLING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. DOUGLASS RE: DEWATERING; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.50	245.00	367.50
12/12/07	RDJ	SEVERAL PHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) AND CITY STAFF RE: WATER SAMPLING RESULTS AND FOLLOW UP TESTING; RESEARCH CONCERNING WATER SAMPLING REQUIREMENTS AND PERMITTING ISSUES;	4.10	195.00	799.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 9

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLEAN WATER ACT; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, T. BEESON AND R. JOEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY.			
12/13/07	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. AHMADI; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM T. BEESON WITH LAB DATA; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.00	245.00	245.00
12/13/07	RDJ	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND T. BEESON TO DISCUSS WATER SAMPLING; RESEARCH CONCERNING WATER SAMPLING REQUIREMENTS, PERMITTING FOR GROUNDWATER DISCHARGE, AND CLEAN WATER ACT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE LAB RESULTS FOR WATER SAMPLES; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, T. BEESON AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: WATER SAMPLING AND PERMITTING ISSUES WITH FOLLOW UP.	4.90	195.00	955.50
12/14/07	RDJ	ORGANIZE FILE; PHONE CONFERENCES WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: WATER SAMPLING AND FOLLOW UP; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RE: DEWATERING MATTER.	1.50	195.00	292.50
12/17/07	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY RE: SECTION 308 OF THE CLEAN WATER ACT; CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY STAFF AND STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ISSUES RAISED IN ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY LETTER.	3.40	195.00	663.00
12/17/07	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. MERRIAM RE: CONTACT WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. DOUGLASS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL DRAFT FROM L. DOUGLASS; REVISE DRAFTS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL TO COUNCIL FROM L. DOUGLASS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL RE: STRP DISTRICTS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW 308 LETTER; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. SHOEMAKER AND R. JOEL; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. DOUGLASS; REVIEW AND REVISE PRESS RELEASE; EMAIL TO L. DOUGLASS.	1.50	245.00	367.50
12/18/07	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING CLEAN WATER ACT AND ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY REGULATIONS TO PREPARE RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER; REVIEW AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS RE: VARIOUS PERMITS AND OTHER INFORMATION	2.70	195.00	526.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010

Invoice 59657

Page 10

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		PERTAINING TO DEWATERING ISSUE.			
12/18/07	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. WILLIAMS AT EAGLE; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.00	245.00	245.00
12/19/07	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLEAN WATER ACT AND ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY REGULATIONS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE WATER SAMPLING RESULTS; SEVERAL PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CONSULTANT, DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF, AND CITY STAFF RE: WATER SAMPLING RESULTS AND REQUIREMENTS FOR NOTICE OF INTENT FOR DISCHARGE OF GROUNDWATER; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; DRAFT LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: NOTICE OF INTENT TO DISCHARGE GROUNDWATER.	6.20	195.00	1,209.00
12/19/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EPA 308 LETTER; PROVIDE TO CLIENT; RECEIVE AND REVIEW LAB DATA; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: CONTACT WITH EPA; RECEIVE AND REVIEW ENCO LAB DATA AND EMAIL FROM T. BEESON; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	2.20	245.00	539.00
12/20/07	RDJ	DRAFT, EDIT AND FINALIZE LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: NOTICE OF INTENT TO DISCHARGE GROUNDWATER AND REVIEW SUPPORTING INFORMATION; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLEAN WATER ACT AND ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY REGULATIONS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF RE: RESPONSE TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY SECTION 308 LETTER AND FOLLOW UP; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY.	4.50	195.00	877.50
12/20/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RESPOND TO SAME; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BUSH RE: EXTENSION AND SCOPE OF RESPONSE; ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY AND D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM B. BUSH; RESPOND TO SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW INFORMATION FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	2.80	245.00	686.00
12/21/07	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING CLEAN WATER ACT AND ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY REGULATIONS; ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR RESPONSE TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY'S SECTION 308 LETTER; RECEIVE AND	1.80	195.00	351.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 11

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		REVIEW GENERIC PERMIT FOR DEWATERING OPERATIONS FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND FOLLOW UP.			
12/21/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL RE: PERMIT ISSUANCE FROM FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RESPOND TO R. JOEL RE: SAME; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME; RESPOND TO EMAIL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL TO A. AHMADI; REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. AHMADI RE: EPA WITH PERMIT.	1.20	245.00	294.00
12/26/07	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RESPOND TO SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW PERMIT FROM FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM T. SHOEMAKER.	0.50	245.00	122.50
12/26/07	RDJ	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF AND SOUTHWEST FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT STAFF RE: DEWATERING PERMIT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE GENERIC PERMIT FOR DISCHARGE OF GROUNDWATER AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION REGULATIONS RE: WATER SAMPLING REQUIREMENTS; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CLEAN WATER ACT AND ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY REGULATIONS.	2.30	195.00	448.50
12/27/07	RDJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND CITY STAFF TO DISCUSS WATER SAMPLING PROTOCOL AND PERMITTING ISSUES; FOLLOW UP STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. BEESON (CDM) AND K. HENNESSY; FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY STAFF RE: DEWATERING ISSUES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS MAPS SHOWING SEWER DISTRICTS, POTENTIAL SAMPLING LOCATIONS AND DISCHARGE POINTS.	3.70	195.00	721.50
12/27/07	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. JOEL RE: SAMPLING; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL AND RESPONSES; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON RE: SAMPLING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM T. SHOEMAKER; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM S. KORF OF THE SOUTHWEST FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT.	1.50	245.00	367.50
12/28/07	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON RE: SAMPLING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM T. BEESON; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.00	245.00	245.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 12

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
12/28/07	RDJ	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY REGULATIONS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE SITE MAPS AND DEWATERING/DISCHARGE PLAN FOR SEPTIC TANK REPLACEMENT PROGRAM ON MARCO ISLAND; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND T. BEESON (CDM) RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO CONSTRUCTION DEWATERING.	2.00	195.00	390.00
12/31/07	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY REGULATIONS; PREPARE RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE RELATED DOCUMENTS.	1.90	195.00	370.50
01/02/08	RDJ	ORGANIZE, REVIEW, AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: SEPTIC TANK REPLACEMENT PROGRAM AND CONSTRUCTION DEWATERING; PREPARE RESPONSE TO LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY.	2.10	195.00	409.50
01/03/08	RDJ	PREPARE RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RE: VARIOUS REQUESTS IN ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY LETTER.	2.00	195.00	390.00
01/03/08	KSH	REVIEW LETTER IN RESPONSE TO SECTION 308.	0.90	245.00	220.50
01/04/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: DEWATERING ACTIVITIES AND PREPARE RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY.	1.00	195.00	195.00
01/07/08	RDJ	PREPARE FOR MEETING, ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS RE: FUTURE PERMITTING AND RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY.	1.20	195.00	234.00
01/07/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL; RESPOND TO SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. JOEL AND T. SHOEMAKER; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.20	245.00	294.00
01/08/08	RDJ	TRAVEL TO AND FROM MARCO ISLAND AND ATTEND MEETING WITH CITY STAFF AND CONSULTANTS RE: APPROACH TO OBTAINING AN ISLAND WIDE DEWATERING PERMIT FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; MEETING WITH CITY STAFF AND CONSULTANT RE: CITY'S RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY AND PREPARE RESPONSE TO SAME.	8.30	195.00	1,618.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 13

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
01/09/08	RDJ	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND ORGANIZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS TO BE SENT TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY IN RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER AND PREPARE RESPONSE TO LETTER.	2.10	195.00	409.50
01/11/08	RDJ	DRAFT COVER LETTER TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY AND RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER; ORGANIZE, REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: DISCHARGES AND OTHER ISSUES RELATED TO SEPTIC TANK REPLACEMENT PROGRAM.	3.40	195.00	663.00
01/11/08	KSH	REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY RE: 308 INQUIRY.	0.60	245.00	147.00
01/14/08	RDJ	DRAFT AND REVISE COVER LETTER TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY AND RESPONSE TO SECTION 308 LETTER AND PREPARE SUBMITTAL; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: SEPTIC TANK REPLACEMENT PROGRAM AND RELATED ACTIVITIES.	5.00	195.00	975.00
01/14/08	KSH	REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED LETTER TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY.	0.70	245.00	171.50
01/15/08	RDJ	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SUBMITTAL TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY; REVISE AND FINALIZE COVER LETTER, RESPONSE, AND SUBMITTAL TO SECTION 308 LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY; TRANSMIT TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY.	3.50	195.00	682.50
01/28/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON RE: WATER QUALITY SAMPLING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW MAP AND DATA RE: WATER QUALITY SAMPLING; FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, R. JOEL AND T. BEESON; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON.	1.00	195.00	195.00
01/28/08	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON RE: SAMPLE RESULTS; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.10	245.00	269.50
01/31/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. JOEL AND T. BEESON RE: DEWATERING ISSUES AND WATER QUALITY SAMPLING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW DATA RE: WATER QUALITY SAMPLING.	0.70	195.00	136.50
01/31/08	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: TESTING, RETESTING AND CONTRACT WITH ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY.	0.50	245.00	122.50
02/06/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE WATER QUALITY SAMPLING INFORMATION AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CONSULTANT RE: SAME.	1.50	195.00	292.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 14

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
02/06/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM T. BEESON; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON TO T. BEESON.	0.30	245.00	73.50
02/08/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM T. BEESON.	0.30	245.00	73.50
02/19/08	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW NOTICE FROM CDM, INC. RE: WORK ASSOCIATED WITH WATER SAMPLING.	0.40	195.00	78.00
02/19/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW LETTER FROM T. BEESON WITH INVOICE FOR SERVICES; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME.	0.30	245.00	73.50
02/22/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE WATER QUALITY SAMPLING REPORT FROM CDM, INC. AND FOLLOW UP.	1.10	195.00	214.50
02/26/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE WATER SAMPLING DATA FROM T. BEESON AND FOLLOW UP.	1.50	195.00	292.50
02/26/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW INVOICES FOR TESTING SERVICES; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	0.40	245.00	98.00
02/27/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON RE: RESULTS OF TESTING.	0.30	245.00	73.50
03/05/08	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND PHONE CONFERENCE WITH CITY STAFF AND CONSULTANT RE: GENERIC PERMIT FOR SHEFFIELD DISTRICT.	0.30	195.00	58.50
03/06/08	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: TESTING RESERVES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL AND T. BEESON.	0.30	245.00	73.50
03/06/08	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: CDM BILLS; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: SAME.	0.30	245.00	73.50
03/06/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF AND T. BEESON (CDM) RE: GENERIC PERMIT FOR SHEFFIELD DISTRICT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE MAP OF SHEFFIELD DISTRICT AND WATER QUALITY APPLICATION.	1.10	195.00	214.50
03/07/08	RDJ	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND REVISE PACKAGE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION FOR GENERIC PERMIT FOR DEWATERING ACTIVITIES IN THE SHEFFIELD DISTRICT AND FOLLOW UP.	2.70	195.00	526.50
03/10/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO A. AHMADI, DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION, RE: GENERIC PERMIT FOR SHEFFIELD DISTRICT AND CONFER WITH T. BEESON, CDM, RE: SAME; FINALIZE PACKAGE FOR DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND TRANSMIT TO CLIENT FOR REVIEW.	0.90	195.00	175.50
03/11/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: REVIEW OF PACKAGE PREPARED FOR DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; FINALIZE LETTER TO A. AHMADI AND TRANSMIT TO T. BEESON, CDM, FOR	0.50	195.00	97.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 15

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		DELIVERY TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.			
03/17/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW LETTER FROM D. JACKSON TO A. AHMADI RE: GENERIC PERMIT REQUEST; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	0.30	245.00	73.50
03/24/08	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW GENERIC PERMIT FOR SHEFFIELD SEWER DISTRICT AND VICINITY; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM).	0.30	195.00	58.50
03/25/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW GENERIC PERMIT; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	0.30	245.00	73.50
03/26/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: ISLAND WIDE GENERIC PERMIT; FOLLOW UP.	0.30	195.00	58.50
03/31/08	RDJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. JOEL, J. MILLER, AND T. BEESON, CDM, RE: ISLAND WIDE PERMIT FOR DEWATERING DISCHARGE AND FOLLOW UP; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON RE: GENERIC PERMIT FOR LAMPLIGHTER AREA; REVIEW AND ANALYZE GENERIC PERMIT FOR RUBY/SEA GRAPE VICINITY.	1.00	195.00	195.00
04/01/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: WATER QUALITY DATA, ISLAND-WIDE PERMIT, AND LAMPLIGHTER DISTRICT; FOLLOW UP WITH CITY STAFF.	0.50	195.00	97.50
04/04/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: WATER QUALITY TESTING AND PERMITTING ISSUES; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: SAME.	0.40	195.00	78.00
04/06/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW NOTICE OF PERMIT.	0.30	245.00	73.50
04/15/08	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: DEWATERING PERMITS FOR LAMPLIGHTER DISTRICT AND ISLAND-WIDE PERMIT; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MILLER RE: PERMITTING ISSUES AND FOLLOW UP.	0.70	195.00	136.50
04/17/08	RDJ	SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH AND PHONE CONFERENCES WITH CITY STAFF AND T. BEESON (CDM) RE: ISSUES WITH LAMPLIGHTER AND ISLAND-WIDE PERMITS.	0.90	195.00	175.50
04/17/08	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: PERMIT STRATEGY.	0.30	245.00	73.50
05/08/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MAPS AND DATA PREPARED BY CDM FOR GENERIC PERMIT FOR DEWATERING FOR ISLAND WIDE UTILITIES PROJECTS AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE COVER LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: GENERIC PERMIT FOR DEWATERING;	1.60	195.00	312.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 16

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: WATERING SAMPLES AND FOLLOW UP.			
05/09/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE INFORMATION FOR NOTICE OF INTENT FOR GENERIC PERMIT FOR ISLAND WIDE DEWATERING AND REVISE LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: SAME.	0.70	195.00	136.50
05/12/08	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW MODIFICATIONS TO NOTICE OF INTENT; LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND FOLLOW UP PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: SAME; REVISE AND FINALIZE LETTER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND FOLLOW UP.	0.50	195.00	97.50
05/15/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: REQUIREMENTS FOR GENERIC PERMITS FOR CONSTRUCTION DEWATERING AND FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. BEESON, R. JOEL AND V. MILLER RE: SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE PERMITS.	0.90	195.00	175.50
05/27/08	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ISLAND WIDE GENERIC PERMIT FOR DEWATERING FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND FOLLOW UP.	0.20	195.00	39.00
06/04/08	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM T. BEESON (CDM) RE: SAMPLING; REVIEW AND ANALYZE RESULTS OF WATER QUALITY SAMPLING; FOLLOW UP RESEARCH CONCERNING WATER QUALITY SAMPLING.	0.80	195.00	156.00
06/05/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: SAMPLING RESULTS AND FOLLOW UP; CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. BEESON, R. JOEL AND J. MILLER.	0.40	195.00	78.00
06/13/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL COVERING NEW MANAGER.	0.20	245.00	49.00
06/30/08	RDJ	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: WATER QUALITY TESTING AND PERMIT CONDITIONS.	0.20	195.00	39.00
10/07/08	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CDM STAFF AND CITY STAFF RE: INVOICE FROM CDM FOR WATER QUALITY TESTING; REVIEW INVOICE AND FOLLOW UP RE: SAME.	0.80	195.00	156.00
10/08/08	RDJ	FOLLOW UP RE: CDM INVOICE FOR WATER QUALITY TESTING.	0.20	195.00	39.00
11/24/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FUMERO.	0.60	245.00	147.00
12/01/08	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL RE: ARSENIC ISSUE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL.	1.20	245.00	294.00
12/03/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS WITH PEACE RIVER	0.50	245.00	122.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 17

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; RECEIVE AND REVIEW PROGRAM GUIDANCE MEMORANDUM.			
12/04/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RESCHEDULE SAME.	0.20	245.00	49.00
12/05/08	MAM	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. JACKSON AND K. HENNESSY RE: PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST TO THE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: ARSENIC CONSENT ORDER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION OMBUDSMAN'S OFFICE.	0.40	100.00	40.00
12/05/08	RDJ	DRAFT PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: WATER QUALITY ISSUE; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY AND M. MARKEN RE: SAME; RESEARCH CONCERNING AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ENFORCEMENT ISSUES.	1.40	195.00	273.00
12/05/08	KSH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME.	0.40	245.00	98.00
12/08/08	MAM	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST; FINALIZE SAME AND TRANSMIT TO B. HAZELTON VIA EMAIL.	0.30	100.00	30.00
12/08/08	KSH	FINALIZE PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST; PREPARE EMAIL TO R. JOEL WITH DRAFT PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.	0.50	245.00	122.50
12/08/08	RDJ	REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MATTER; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; REVISE AND FINALIZE PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND TRANSMIT SAME.	1.70	195.00	331.50
12/11/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL WITH DOCUMENTS FROM LEE COUNTY; EMAIL R. JOEL.	1.00	245.00	245.00
12/15/08	MAM	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY AND D. JACKSON; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL REGULATION OFFICE OF THE GENERAL COUNSEL; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. HAZELTON RE: RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND ATTACHMENTS FROM B. HAZELTON.	0.80	100.00	80.00
12/15/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.	0.50	245.00	122.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 18

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
12/15/08	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. CHRISTEN OF DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH K. HENNESSY AND M. MARKEN RE: SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW GENERAL INFORMATION ON CONSENT ORDERS FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	0.80	195.00	156.00
12/17/08	MAM	PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL TO B. HAZELTON; STRATEGY SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. HAZELTON.	0.40	100.00	40.00
12/17/08	RDJ	REVIEW INFORMATION ON CONSENT ORDERS PROVIDED BY DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND FOLLOW UP WORK SESSION WITH M. MARKEN; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: STATUS OF PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.	0.60	195.00	117.00
12/18/08	MAM	RECEIVE AND REVIEW INCOMING RECORDS IN RESPONSE TO OUR PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST DATED DECEMBER 8, 2008; ANALYZE, PREPARE AND ORGANIZE SAME; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.40	100.00	140.00
12/18/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION INITIAL RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST; FORWARD SAME TO R. JOEL AT CITY.	1.30	245.00	318.50
12/18/08	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST AND FOLLOW UP RE: SAME.	1.10	195.00	214.50
12/19/08	KSH	PREPARE AUDIT LETTER RESPONSE; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.	1.00	245.00	245.00
12/24/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW PROGRAM GUIDANCE MEMORANDUM; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST.	1.20	245.00	294.00
12/29/08	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL; RESPOND TO SAME.	0.30	245.00	73.50
12/30/08	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST AND FOLLOW UP RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, R. JOEL AND B. WEINSTEIN AND FOLLOW UP RE: SAME.	3.20	195.00	624.00
12/30/08	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. JOEL AND	1.50	245.00	367.50

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 19

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		RESPOND TO SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FUMERO; RECEIVE AND REVIEW AND FINALIZE AUDIT LETTER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL.			
01/07/09	MAM	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. FUMERO RE: POLICY MEMO ON AQUIFER STORAGE.	0.20	105.00	21.00
01/08/09	KSH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: STATUS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FUMERO.	0.30	250.00	75.00
01/12/09	KSH	SCHEDULE MEETING WITH LEE COUNTY AND MARCO ISLAND.	0.30	250.00	75.00
01/23/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: ENFORCEMENT RELATED TO ASR WELLS AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH LEE COUNTY.	2.20	200.00	440.00
01/26/09	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: MEETING WITH LEE COUNTY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: MEETING.	0.50	250.00	125.00
01/26/09	RDJ	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH LEE COUNTY REPRESENTATIVES; REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELL PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT; TRAVEL TO AND FROM FORT MYERS, FLORIDA TO ATTEND MEETING WITH LEE COUNTY REPRESENTATIVES, MARCO ISLAND REPRESENTATIVES R. JOEL AND B. WEINSTEIN, AND L. HORVATH OF ENTRIX, AND J. FUMERO RE: LEE COUNTY.	6.80	200.00	1,360.00
01/27/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; FORWARD EMAIL; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: MEETING; SCHEDULE TALLAHASSEE MEETING WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	0.50	250.00	125.00
01/27/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE: SCHEDULING OF MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RE: PERMITTING AD ENFORCEMENT RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	1.90	200.00	380.00
01/28/09	KSH	SCHEDULE MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN TALLAHASSEE.	0.20	250.00	50.00
01/29/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION	2.50	200.00	500.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 20

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		PROCEDURES FOR ENFORCEMENT AND PERMITTING FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RELATED TO CITY OF MARCO ISLAND'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS.			
01/30/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RELATED TO CITY OF MARCO ISLAND'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION POLICIES ON PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES; PREPARE SUMMARY OF DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES.	4.40	200.00	880.00
02/02/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RELATED TO CLIENT'S PERMITS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; SUMMARIZE DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES TO PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	3.50	200.00	700.00
02/03/09	RDJ	DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: STATUS OF CLIENT'S PERMITS RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION POLICIES ON PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: SAME; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: VARIOUS ISSUES.	3.50	200.00	700.00
02/05/09	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELL PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT AND PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE: THE SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE TECHNICAL PAPER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO CITY'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.	3.90	200.00	780.00
02/05/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; FORWARD TO D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. MAUER.	0.50	250.00	125.00
02/06/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE TECHNICAL PAPER TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES AND	4.30	200.00	860.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 21

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION POLICIES RE: PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF SAME; PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE: SAME TO PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.			
02/09/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RE: PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT ISSUES RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY WELLS AND DOCUMENTS RE: CITY'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; REVIEW RELATED ISSUES AND PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE: SAME.	3.00	200.00	600.00
02/10/09	RDJ	DRAFT AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: ISSUES RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS AND CLIENT DOCUMENTS RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	3.40	200.00	680.00
02/12/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CLIENT DOCUMENTS RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RE: PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; DRAFT AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: VARIOUS ISSUES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	2.80	200.00	560.00
02/13/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RE: CITY'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RE: PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; DRAFT AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: ISSUES AND FOLLOW UP RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME.	2.90	200.00	580.00
02/17/09	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT AND PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE: SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE CLIENT DOCUMENTS AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; REVIEW AND REVISE MEMORANDUM PREPARED BY ENTRIX.	3.40	200.00	680.00
02/17/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL WITH	1.50	250.00	375.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 22

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		REVISED REPORT; RESPOND TO SAME; SCHEDULE CONFERENCE CALL.			
02/18/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: ARSENIC ISSUES; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, B. WEINSTEIN, M. PEARCE AND L. HORVATH OF ENTRIX, AND R. JOEL.	4.80	200.00	960.00
02/18/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT REPORT ON ARSENIC; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM.	4.00	250.00	1,000.00
02/19/09	RDJ	DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING AND OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE CLIENT DOCUMENTS AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION DOCUMENTS RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY.	3.20	200.00	640.00
02/19/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; PREPARE OUTLINE OF DISCUSSION POINTS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. FUMERO; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FUMERO.	1.10	250.00	275.00
02/20/09	RDJ	RESEARCH CONCERNING ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING AND OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY SYSTEMS; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: VARIOUS ISSUES TO BE ADDRESSED IN MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	4.80	200.00	960.00
02/23/09	RDJ	DRAFT AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO CONSTRUCTION AND OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RESEARCH CONCERNING SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW POWERPOINT PRESENTATION PREPARED BY ENTRIX FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	4.90	200.00	980.00
02/23/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ARSENIC CHEMISTRY MEMORANDUM; RECEIVE AND REVIEW POWERPOINT	2.90	250.00	725.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 23

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		PRESENTATION; PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.			
02/24/09	RDJ	REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: ISSUES RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING AND ENFORCEMENT OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RE: SAME; ORGANIZE MATERIALS FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION	4.90	200.00	980.00
02/24/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS RE: OUTLINE OF TASKS; RESPOND TO SAME; PREPARE OUTLINE; EMAIL TO TEAM.	2.50	250.00	625.00
02/25/09	KSH	PREPARE OUTLINE FOR DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEETING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FUMERO RE: SAME; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM TEAM; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: RESPONSES.	1.90	250.00	475.00
02/25/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: VARIOUS ISSUES TO DISCUSS AT MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RESEARCH CONCERNING VARIOUS RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS RE: SAME; REVIEW AND ORGANIZE MATERIALS FOR DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEETING; STRATEGY SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN.	5.70	200.00	1,140.00
02/26/09	RDJ	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY TO PREPARE FOR TALLAHASSEE MEETING.	0.30	200.00	60.00
02/26/09	RDJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. FUMERO AND K. HENNESSY; REVIEW AND REVISE AND FINALIZE MEMORANDUM RE: ISSUES TO DISCUSS WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND REVIEW AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION ON AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES.	1.80	200.00	360.00
02/26/09	KSH	TRAVEL TO TALLAHASSEE TO ATTEND FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEETINGS; PREPARE FOR MEETING.	6.00	250.00	1,500.00
02/27/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH FLORIDA	8.00	250.00	2,000.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010

Invoice 59657

Page 24

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN TALLAHASSEE; ATTEND PRE-MEETING WITH TEAM; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH TEAM AFTER MEETING; RETURN TO BRADENTON.			
03/02/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. FUMERO RE: STATUS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL RE: STATUS.	0.20	250.00	50.00
03/04/09	KSH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: MEETING; PREPARE DRAFT MINUTES; EMAIL OUT TO TEAM MEMBERS; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH.	1.90	250.00	475.00
03/04/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MINUTES TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEETING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO MEETING MINUTES.	1.00	200.00	200.00
03/05/09	KSH	PHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FUMERO; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL WITH COMMENTS FROM W. WEINSTEIN; WORK ON MINUTES; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON.	3.00	250.00	750.00
03/05/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW REVISIONS TO DRAFT MEETING MINUTES AND REVISE SAME; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS.	1.90	200.00	380.00
03/06/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS WITH REVISIONS; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: REVIEWING APPLICATION FOR PERMIT.	0.50	250.00	125.00
03/06/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: REVISIONS TO DRAFT MEETING MINUTES AND FOLLOW UP; REVISE MINUTES FROM MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.80	200.00	360.00
03/09/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CHANGES FROM T. HILL OF LEE COUNTY; FORWARD TO D. JACKSON; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: MINUTES.	0.30	250.00	75.00
03/09/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW COMMENTS, REVISIONS TO DRAFT MINUTES FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; REVISE DRAFT MINUTES FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH VARIOUS MEETING ATTENDEES RE: CLARIFICATION OF MINUTES.	2.20	200.00	440.00
03/10/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH W. WEINSTEIN RE: VARIOUS	1.50	200.00	300.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010

Invoice 59657

Page 25

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		ISSUES WITH DRAFT MINUTES OF MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW COMMENTS FROM CONSULTANTS RE: MEETING MINUTES; REVISE AND FINALIZE DRAFT MINUTES OF MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES.			
03/17/09	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL TO FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION WITH MINUTES.	0.50	250.00	125.00
03/17/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; REVISE AND FINALIZE MINUTES FROM MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES AND TRANSMIT SAME TO J. LLEWELLYN AT DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	0.90	200.00	180.00
03/27/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. WEINSTEIN; REVIEW, ANALYZE AND ORGANIZE DRAFT PERMIT APPLICATION AND EXHIBITS FOR OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	2.80	200.00	560.00
03/31/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT PERMIT SUBMITTAL FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY OPERATION.	1.70	200.00	340.00
04/01/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT REPORT TO ACCOMPANY PERMIT APPLICATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.	2.20	200.00	440.00
04/02/09	RDJ	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND REVISE REPORT AND EXHIBITS RELATED TO PERMIT APPLICATION FOR CITY'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT PERMIT APPLICATIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMIT APPLICATIONS.	4.70	200.00	940.00
04/03/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT PERMIT APPLICATIONS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES AND RELATED REPORT, FIGURES, EXHIBITS AND COVER LETTER; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: REVISIONS TO DOCUMENTS; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: REVISIONS TO DOCUMENTS.	4.00	200.00	800.00
04/03/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW APPLICATION FOR ASR; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL TO R. JOEL FROM D. JACKSON.	1.80	250.00	450.00
04/06/09	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON RE: LETTER TO	0.50	250.00	125.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 26

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.			
04/06/09	RDJ	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND REVISE COVER LETTER, PERMIT APPLICATIONS AND RELATED DOCUMENTS FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY OPERATIONAL PERMIT; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT, CONSULTANTS RE: REVISIONS TO DOCUMENTS.	3.00	200.00	600.00
04/07/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE APPLICATIONS AND RELATED DOCUMENTS FOR OPERATIONAL PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: REVISIONS TO PERMIT APPLICATIONS.	1.50	200.00	300.00
04/08/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION WITH APPLICATION.	0.30	250.00	75.00
04/08/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW REVISED COVER LETTER AND APPLICATIONS FOR OPERATIONAL PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY AND FOLLOW UP WITH CONSULTANT RE: SAME.	0.70	200.00	140.00
04/15/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; REVIEW AND REVISE COVER LETTER.	0.60	250.00	150.00
04/15/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. HABERFELD AND J. LLEWELLYN, DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION, RE: STATUS OF DEPARTMENT'S REVIEW OF MINUTES FROM MEETING TO DISCUSS VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.	0.50	200.00	100.00
04/16/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. LLEWELLYN; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON TO R. JOEL.	0.50	250.00	125.00
04/16/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. LLEWELLYN RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S REVIEW OF MINUTES FROM MEETING ABOUT AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES AND FOLLOW UP; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. JOEL, J. MILLER AND T. BEESON (CDM) RE: FIELD WORK IN NEW SEWER DISTRICTS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE PERMITS AND RELATED DOCUMENTS; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON.	1.30	200.00	260.00
04/20/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: STATUS OF	0.40	200.00	80.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 27

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		MINUTES FROM MEETING TO DISCUSS AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY RELATED ISSUES.			
04/23/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON TO J. LLEWELLYN.	0.20	250.00	50.00
04/23/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION STAFF RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S REVIEW OF MINUTES FROM MEETING ABOUT AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES AND FOLLOW UP.	0.40	200.00	80.00
04/27/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; REVIEW AND REVISE MINUTES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. LLEWELLYN; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL TO R. JOEL AND TEAM WITH MINUTES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSES FROM TEAM; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON.	1.00	250.00	250.00
04/27/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: REVISIONS TO MINUTES FROM MEETING ON AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY RELATED ISSUES; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: TRANSMITTAL LETTER FOR PERMIT APPLICATIONS.	1.40	200.00	280.00
04/28/09	RDJ	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO REVISIONS PROPOSED BY DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION TO MINUTES FROM MEETING RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY RELATED ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: SAME.	1.50	200.00	300.00
04/29/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE REVISIONS PROPOSED BY DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION TO MINUTES FROM MEETING RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY RELATED ISSUES; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.	0.50	200.00	100.00
05/05/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL WITH DRAFT MINUTES FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	0.30	250.00	75.00
05/05/09	RDJ	REVISE MINUTES FROM MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY ISSUES; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. FUMERO RE: LEE	0.60	200.00	120.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 28

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		COUNTY'S POSITION ON DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S REVISIONS TO MEETING MINUTES; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.			
05/06/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CITY STAFF AND CONSULTANT RE: SAMPLING FOR KENDALL AND MACKLE SEWER DISTRICTS AND FOLLOW UP.	0.20	200.00	40.00
05/11/09	RDJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. FUMERO AND K. HENNESSY RE: STRATEGY FOR RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S COMMENTS ON MEETING MINUTES AND FOLLOW UP.	0.30	200.00	60.00
05/15/09	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: REVISIONS TO MINUTES AND OTHER ISSUES.	0.30	250.00	75.00
05/26/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. RHODES, FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION, RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY OPERATION PERMIT APPLICATION AND FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: SAME.	0.40	200.00	80.00
05/27/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. BEESON (CDM) RE: WATER QUALITY TESTING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT RE: AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY PERMIT ISSUES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW DRAFT COMMENTS PREPARED BY CONSULTANT IN RESPONSE TO COMMENTS FROM FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.10	200.00	220.00
05/27/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL; SCHEDULE CONFERENCE CALL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION LETTER IN RESPONSE TO APPLICATION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW COMMENTS TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION LETTER.	1.50	250.00	375.00
05/29/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE WATER QUALITY DATA FROM CDM FOR KENDALL AND MACKLE PARK SEWER DISTRICTS AND FOLLOW UP.	2.40	200.00	480.00
06/01/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE LEE COUNTY DRAFT PERMIT AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER, CLIENT'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION AND VARIOUS OTHER DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS.	1.40	200.00	280.00
06/01/09	KSH	REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER FROM FLORIDA	2.00	250.00	500.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 29

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION FOR CONFERENCE CALL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL WITH COMMENTS FROM B. WEINSTEIN FOR CONFERENCE CALL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW LEE COUNTY DRAFT PERMIT; EMAIL D. JACKSON AND J. FUMERO; REVIEW DRAFT PERMIT TO J. FUMERO.			
06/02/09	RDJ	WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN, CITY OF MARCO ISLAND, AND L. HORVATH, ENTRIX WATER SOLUTIONS RE: MARCO ISLAND PERMIT APPLICATION REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.	2.00	200.00	400.00
06/02/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY PERMIT, PENDING REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION AND DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION POLICIES TO PREPARE FOR MEETING.	2.00	200.00	400.00
06/02/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RESPOND TO SAME; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: ISSUES AND ADDITIONAL WORK; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH MARCO ISLAND.	1.90	250.00	475.00
06/05/09	RDJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: LEE COUNTY ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER.	0.20	200.00	40.00
06/10/09	RDJ	REVIEW DRAFT REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RESPONSE AND WATER QUALITY INFORMATION RELATED TO OPERATION OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.	1.00	200.00	200.00
06/17/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION GUIDANCE MEMO AND DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PERMITTING OF CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES, AND LEE COUNTY'S DRAFT PERMIT AND ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER; SUMMARIZE ISSUES, PREPARE QUESTIONS, AND CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND LEE COUNTY REPRESENTATIVES TO DISCUSS ISSUES AND STRATEGY RE: PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	3.90	200.00	780.00
06/17/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH LEE COUNTY AND MARCO ISLAND PERSONNEL; PHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JOEL; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW REVISIONS TO THE DRAFT ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER AND	2.30	250.00	575.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 30

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.			
06/18/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE WATER QUALITY DATA AND EXHIBIT RE: SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES.	2.00	200.00	400.00
06/19/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE REVISED WATER QUALITY FIGURE AND DRAFT REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: PERMIT APPLICATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITIES; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: REVISIONS TO EXHIBIT.	2.50	200.00	500.00
06/19/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM M. PEARCE TO J. HABERFELD; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EXHIBIT; EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON WITH COMMENTS; PHONE CALL TO J. LLEWELLYN'S OFFICE, LEAVE VOICE MAIL.	2.00	250.00	500.00
06/29/09	KSH	WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: STATUS; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS WITH LATEST CHANGES TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. HABERFIELD; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CORAM; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. WEINSTEIN; PREPARE EMAIL TO J. COWAN; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH.	2.70	250.00	675.00
06/29/09	RDJ	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RESPONSE AND EXHIBIT RE: WATER QUALITY DATA AND FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANT RE: SAME; CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY AND B. WEINSTEIN; RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. HENNESSY TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: CLIENT'S CONCERNS.	2.00	200.00	400.00
07/02/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE: RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.	0.20	200.00	40.00
07/03/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RESPOND TO SAME.	0.30	250.00	75.00
07/06/09	KSH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CORAN RE: REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION AND RECENT EMAIL FROM D. RHODES; EMAIL P. CORAN; EMAIL R. JOEL.	0.50	250.00	125.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 31

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
07/07/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMIT RENEWAL.	0.80	200.00	160.00
07/07/09	KSH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CORAN; EXCHANGE EMAILS; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION IN TALLAHASSEE; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY, AND REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RESPONSE; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL.	1.50	250.00	375.00
07/13/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMIT RENEWAL; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO SAME.	1.30	200.00	260.00
07/13/09	KSH	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON; PREPARE EMAIL TO R. JOEL; SCHEDULE MEETING; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. JOEL AND L. HORVATH.	1.00	250.00	250.00
07/14/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND REVISE REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMIT; CONFER WITH K. HENNESSY RE: SAME.	0.60	200.00	120.00
07/14/09	KSH	PREPARE EMAIL TO R. JOEL RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE; SCHEDULE CONFERENCE CALL.	0.50	250.00	125.00
07/15/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WEINSTEIN; RESPOND TO SAME.	0.20	250.00	50.00
07/16/09	RDJ	EDIT DRAFT LETTER TO FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: CITY OF MARCO ISLAND, MARCO LAKES AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY APPLICATION.	0.50	200.00	100.00
07/17/09	RDJ	FINALIZE EDITS TO DRAFT LETTER TO FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RE: CITY OF MARCO ISLAND, MARCO LAKES AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY APPLICATION; CIRCULATE DRAFT VIA EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO R. JOEL, B. WEINSTEIN, AND L. HORVATH; PARTICIPATE ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, R. JOEL, B. WEINSTEIN, AND L. HORVATH FOR DISCUSSION OF DRAFT RESPONSE LETTER TO FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	2.00	200.00	400.00
07/17/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW VARIOUS DOCUMENTS FROM	1.90	200.00	380.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 32

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		ENTRIX RE: WATER QUALITY DATA; REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; WORK SESSION WITH K. HENNESSY; PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH K. HENNESSY, CLIENT, AND CONSULTANTS RE: RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION AND RELATED ISSUES.			
07/20/09	KSH	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER TO D. RHODES; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. JACKSON.	0.50	250.00	125.00
07/20/09	RDJ	REVISE RESPONSE TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RE: CLIENT'S AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMIT RENEWAL.	1.70	200.00	340.00
07/21/09	KSH	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. JOEL RE: MEETING ON SITE; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. JOEL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW REVISED REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RESPONSE.	1.00	250.00	250.00
07/21/09	RDJ	REVISE AND FINALIZE RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMIT; FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS RE: SAME.	1.10	200.00	220.00
07/24/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH WITH REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION LETTER; DRAFT RESPONSE.	0.50	250.00	125.00
07/27/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE REVISED RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMIT RENEWAL AND EXHIBITS RELATED TO SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE COMMENTS FROM B. WEINSTEIN RE: REVISED DOCUMENTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. HORVATH RE: REVISIONS TO DOCUMENTS AND FOLLOW UP.	1.20	200.00	240.00
07/28/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE COMMENTS FROM M. PEARCE (ENTRIX) RE: REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.	0.20	200.00	40.00
07/31/09	RDJ	CONFER WITH ENTRIX RE: STATUS OF RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; FOLLOW UP WITH K. HENNESSY.	0.20	200.00	40.00
08/03/09	RDJ	RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY PERMIT FROM ENTRIX.	0.30	200.00	60.00
08/13/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW INFORMATION FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY TO QUALITY	1.60	250.00	400.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
 Invoice 59657
 Page 33

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		FROM P. GENZLER; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL WITH LETTER FROM ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY TO MARCO ISLAND; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON TO QUALITY ENTERPRISES.			
08/19/09	KSH	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH CITY OF MARCO ISLAND AND QUALITY ENTERPRISES; WORK SESSION WITH D. JACKSON RE: SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. GENZLER TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM MARCO ISLAND.	1.50	250.00	375.00
08/20/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. GENZLER RE: SCHEDULING CALL WITH ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. JACKSON; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. CAPLAN; RECEIVE AND REVIEW RESPONSE FROM P. GENZLER.	1.30	250.00	325.00
08/24/09	KSH	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: RESPONSE TO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM MARCO ISLAND WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION RESPONSE TO APPLICATION; SCHEDULE MEETING WITH CLIENT.	1.00	250.00	250.00
08/24/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RE: PERMIT FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. WEINSTEIN RE: SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PERMIT APPLICATION FOR AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY; SEVERAL EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT, CONSULTANTS RE: LETTER FROM DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION.	1.70	200.00	340.00
08/25/09	RDJ	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT AND CONSULTANTS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE COMMENTS ON DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RE: PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	0.40	200.00	80.00
08/27/09	RDJ	DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND RELATED ISSUES; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND	2.10	200.00	420.00

Lewis, Longman & Walker, PA

CITY OF MARCO ISLAND

April 13, 2010
Invoice 59657
Page 34

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT, CONSULTANTS RE: DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION'S REQUEST FOR INFORMATION AND FOLLOW UP.			
08/27/09	KSH	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. JACKSON RE: CONFERENCE CALL; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. JOEL.	1.00	250.00	250.00
08/28/09	RDJ	DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	1.00	200.00	200.00
08/28/09	KSH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. RHODES; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM L. HORVATH; RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM M. PEARCE.	0.50	250.00	125.00
08/31/09	RDJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE OUTLINE FOR MEETING WITH DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CONSULTANTS RE: SAME; DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE: PERMITTING OF AQUIFER STORAGE AND RECOVERY FACILITY.	1.80	200.00	360.00
Total Fees			479.60		101,289.00

Disbursements

Date	Description	Amount
	COST SURCHARGE	3,545.17
12/10/07	TRAVEL TO ATTEND HEARING WITH DEP IN COLLIER COUNTY ON 11/27/07 ; KEVIN HENNESSY	76.75
	COMPUTER RESEARCH	27.84
01/14/08	TELEPHONE CHARGES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCING-DAVID JACKSON	12.38
01/25/08	POSTAGE CHARGES; POSTAGE FOR DOCUMENTS SENT TO EPA	5.02
03/01/08	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	34,607.77
04/01/08	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED ; CAMP DRESSER & MCKEE INC. (CDM)	27,539.51
05/29/08	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FOR THE PERIOD OF 11/30/07-5/10/08 ; CAMP DRESSER & MCKEE INC. (CDM)	21,363.49
10/01/08	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH SEPTEMBER 27, 2008 ; CAMP DRESSER & MCKEE INC. (CDM)	8,342.05
03/19/09	BUSINESS MEETING; TRAVEL TO TALLAHASSEE FOR MEETNG WITH FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 2/27/09-2/28/09 ; KEVIN HENNESSY	560.59
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL CHARGES	166.26
10/01/09	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES; FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED; CAMP DRESSER & MCKEE INC.	5,886.83
Total Disbursements		102,133.66